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THE CURRICULUM

Williams College offers a course of study leading to the degree of Bachelor of Arts. The
course requirements prescribe both the number of courses to be completed and the minimum
grade level to be achieved; the curriculum also requires that each student explore several
fields of knowledge and concentrate in one. The full requirements for the degree include
meeting the minimum academic standards stated below, residence at the College, fulfillment
of the distribution requirement, completion of a major, and completion of the physical edu-
cation requirement.

The academic year is divided into two regular semesters and a Winter Study Program. The
student takes four courses in each semester and during January pursues a single program of
study on a pass-fail basis.

The Winter Study Program, which began in 1967, is intended to provide students and fac-
ulty with a dramatically different educational experience in the January term. The differ-
ences are in the nature of the courses, the nature of the learning experience, and the change of
educational pace and format from the fall and spring semesters. These differences apply to
the faculty and students in,several ways: faculty can try out courses with new subjects and
techniques that might, if successful, be used later in the regular terms; they can explore sub-
jects not amenable to inclusion in regular courses; and they can investigate fields outside
their usual areas of expertise. In their academic work, which is graded Honors, Pass, Per-
functory Pass, or Fail, students can explore new fields at low risk, concentrate on one subject
that requires a great deal of time, develop individual research projects, or work in a different
milieu (as interns, for example, or on trips outside Williamstown). In addition, Winter Study
offers students an opportunity for more independence and initiative in a less formal setting,
more opportunity to participate in cultural events, and an occasion to get to know one an-
other better.

REQUIREMENTS FOR THE BACHELOR OF ARTS DEGREE

Academic Requirement

To be eligible for the Bachelor of Arts degree a student must pass 32 regularly graded se-
mester courses and receive grades of C minus or higher in at least 19 of those semester
courses, pass four Winter Study Projects, fulfill the distribution requirement, attain an aver-
age of C minus or higher in the major field, and complete the physical education require-
ment.

Residence Requirement

Students who begin college at Williams must spend a minimum of six semesters in resi-
dence at Williams. Students transferring to Williams from other institutions must spend a
minimum of four semesters in residence at Williams, and those entering as sophomores are
expected to spend six semesters in residence. Students are considered to be in residence if
they are taking a program of study under the direction of the Williams College Faculty. Stu-
dents must be in residence for both semesters of the final year.

The degree requirements must be completed within eight semesters, including any semes-
ters for which a student receives credit while not in residence at Williams. Thus, semesters
spent away on exchange programs with other colleges or on junior year abroad are included
in the eight semesters. Similarly, if a student requests, and the Committee on Academic
Standing grants, degree credit based on Advanced Placement scores, then these semesters
are also included in the limit of eight.
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